
ITEM NO. AVI-SPL CAMCOR, INC
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COMPETITIVE 
EDGE

DATEL 
SYSTEMS, INC.

DLP LAMP 
SOURCE

GOLDEN STAR 
TECHNOLOGY (GST)

PATHWAY 
COMM.

PROJECTOR 
LAMP 

EXPERTS

PYRAMID 
SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS
QUILL SCOTT 

ELECTRIC

SEHI 
COMPUTER 
PRODUCTS
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BULB CO. TROXELL VALIANT IMC

1 (a) NO BID $5.99 NO BID $3.50 $15.00 $4.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.19 $14.90 $2.85 $25.00 $3.82 NO BID $3.89

2 (a) NO BID NO BID NO BID $230.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $181.00 $265.95 NO BID $244.33 NO BID $185.00 $203.46 NO BID

3 (a) $369.56 $357.00 NO BID $340.00 NO BID $163.00 NO BID NO BID $315.00 $399.95 NO BID $369.07 NO BID $179.00 $352.91 $367.00

4 (a) $336.95 $326.72 NO BID $305.00 NO BID $180.00 NO BID NO BID $294.00 $363.95 NO BID $334.02 NO BID $240.00 $322.08 $335.50

5 (a) $347.82 $336.93 NO BID $290.00 NO BID $138.00 NO BID NO BID $278.50 $319.95 NO BID $285.00 NO BID $209.00 $332.29 $346.00

6 (a) $347.82 $336.93 NO BID $305.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $275.00 $349.95 NO BID $315.00 NO BID NO BID $332.50 $346.00

7 (a) $293.47 $288.40 NO BID $319.00 NO BID $138.00 NO BID NO BID $279.50 $350.95 NO BID $315.00 NO BID NO BID $281.48 $293.50

8 (a) $336.95 $323.20 NO BID $319.00 NO BID $157.00 NO BID NO BID $283.50 $353.95 NO BID $330.00 NO BID NO BID $322.30 $335.50

9 (a) $239.13 NO BID NO BID $299.00 NO BID $169.00 NO BID NO BID $225.00 $332.95 NO BID $300.00 NO BID $204.00 $227.96 $241.00

10 (a) $293.47 $286.16 NO BID $319.00 NO BID $138.00 NO BID NO BID $279.50 $363.95 NO BID $321.65 NO BID $208.00 $281.48 $293.50

CATEGORY A - ORIGINAL MANUFACTURER LAMPS

NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM
BID NO. 1343-N, LCD PROJECTOR LAMPS
FOR PERIOD OF SEPTEMBER 1, 2011 THRU AUGUST 31, 2012

BID RE-CAP, Bids Opened 8/11/10, 2:00 p.m.
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NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM
BID NO. 1343-N, LCD PROJECTOR LAMPS
FOR PERIOD OF SEPTEMBER 1, 2011 THRU AUGUST 31, 2012

BID RE-CAP, Bids Opened 8/11/10, 2:00 p.m.

11 (a) $293.47 NO BID NO BID $309.00 NO BID $138.00 NO BID NO BID $281.50 $363.95 NO BID $315.00 NO BID $208.00 $281.48 $293.50

12 (a) $293.47 $286.16 NO BID $319.00 NO BID $138.00 NO BID NO BID $279.50 $350.95 NO BID $315.00 NO BID $208.00 $281.27 $293.50

13 (a) $336.95 $326.72 NO BID $305.00 NO BID $150.00 NO BID NO BID $284.00 $363.95 NO BID $330.00 NO BID $194.00 $322.30 $335.50

14 (a) $293.47 $286.16 NO BID $330.00 NO BID $175.00 NO BID NO BID $305.00 $387.95 NO BID $356.70 NO BID $234.00 $281.27 $293.50

15 (a) $293.47 $286.16 NO BID $335.00 NO BID $219.00 NO BID NO BID $282.10 $412.95 NO BID $381.44 NO BID NO BID $281.71 $293.50

16 (a) $336.95 $321.18 NO BID $310.00 NO BID $157.00 NO BID NO BID $287.50 $363.95 NO BID $330.00 NO BID NO BID $322.30 $335.50

17 (a) NO BID NO BID NO BID $279.00 NO BID $119.00 NO BID NO BID $269.89 $312.95 NO BID $277.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

18 (a) $399.00 $414.96 $368.00 $289.00 $404.25 $213.00 $396.02 NO BID $288.50 $323.95 $449.00 $288.00 $386.00 $255.00 $287.75 $396.40

19 (a) $326.08 $342.05 $300.00 $369.00 $332.25 $200.00 $322.85 NO BID $375.00 $429.95 $359.00 $398.97 $318.00 NO BID $348.67 $325.00

20 (a) $157.60 $164.36 $145.00 $185.00 $165.25 $130.00 $156.04 NO BID $189.00 $232.95 $179.00 $204.13 $153.25 $288.00 $172.23 $161.25

21 (a) $326.08 $338.68 $300.00 $369.00 $332.25 $200.00 $322.84 NO BID $380.00 $429.95 $367.00 $398.97 $320.00 NO BID $312.60 $325.00
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NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM
BID NO. 1343-N, LCD PROJECTOR LAMPS
FOR PERIOD OF SEPTEMBER 1, 2011 THRU AUGUST 31, 2012

BID RE-CAP, Bids Opened 8/11/10, 2:00 p.m.

22 (a) $157.00 $163.40 $145.00 $185.00 $165.25 $130.00 $156.04 NO BID $180.00 $257.95 $179.00 $228.87 $155.00 NO BID $172.23 $161.25

23 (a) $236.95 $247.65 $218.00 $309.00 $243.50 NO BID $234.60 NO BID $275.00 $369.95 $279.00 $340.21 $230.00 NO BID $255.56 $238.90

24 (a) $360.86 $378.30 $332.00 $379.00 $366.85 $163.00 $357.28 NO BID $390.00 $474.95 $396.00 $443.30 $358.00 NO BID $385.72 $358.60

25 (a) $157.60 $164.81 $145.00 $185.00 $165.25 $163.00 $156.04 NO BID $184.00 $263.95 $174.00 $235.05 $155.00 NO BID $175.92 $161.25

26 (a) $236.95 $244.09 $218.00 $279.00 $244.50 $163.00 $234.60 NO BID $256.00 $307.95 $255.00 $278.35 $228.00 NO BID $265.44 $238.90

27 (a) $157.60 $167.61 $145.00 $185.00 $165.25 $156.00 $156.04 NO BID $175.00 $232.95 $170.00 $204.12 $153.00 NO BID $172.23 $161.25

28 (a) $277.17 $286.51 $255.00 $289.00 $283.75 $186.00 $274.42 NO BID $299.00 $349.95 $299.00 $319.59 $272.00 NO BID $293.95 $277.75

29 (a) $157.60 $162.71 $145.00 $179.00 $165.25 $156.00 $157.60 NO BID $179.00 $237.95 $169.00 $208.25 $155.00 NO BID $178.78 $161.25

30 (a) $155.43 $161.32 $143.00 $185.00 $162.90 $163.00 $155.42 NO BID $279.00 $337.95 $165.00 $307.22 $151.00 NO BID $177.27 $160.00

31 (a) $440.21 $447.67 $405.00 $439.00 $445.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID $440.00 $524.95 $464.00 $492.78 $433.00 NO BID $356.11 $435.25

32 (a) $284.78 $296.04 $262.00 $350.00 $290.80 $237.00 NO BID NO BID $319.00 $357.95 $309.00 $327.84 $280.00 NO BID $309.77 $285.10

33 (a) $236.95 $244.61 $218.00 $260.00 $244.50 $188.00 NO BID NO BID $275.00 $312.95 $258.00 $282.47 $232.00 NO BID $255.56 $238.90
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NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM
BID NO. 1343-N, LCD PROJECTOR LAMPS
FOR PERIOD OF SEPTEMBER 1, 2011 THRU AUGUST 31, 2012

BID RE-CAP, Bids Opened 8/11/10, 2:00 p.m.

34 (a) $155.43 $161.32 $143.00 $220.00 $162.90 $156.00 NO BID NO BID $165.00 $262.95 $170.00 $232.99 $155.00 NO BID $169.95 $160.00

35 (a) $236.95 $250.79 $237.00 $300.00 $244.50 $200.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $257.00 $249.48 $233.00 NO BID $207.39 $238.90

36 (a) $140.21 $151.24 NO BID $209.00 $147.65 NO BID $141.38 NO BID $190.00 $262.95 $154.00 $232.99 $139.00 NO BID $147.96 NO BID

37 (a) $168.47 $182.58 NO BID $219.00 $174.95 NO BID $169.88 NO BID $190.00 $312.95 $179.00 $282.47 $165.00 NO BID $168.37 NO BID

38 (a) $298.91 $213.15 NO BID $265.00 $250.65 NO BID NO BID NO BID $255.00 $307.95 NO BID $278.35 NO BID NO BID $244.90 NO BID

39 (a) $244.56 NO BID NO BID $265.00 $250.65 NO BID NO BID NO BID $255.00 $307.95 NO BID $278.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

40 (a) $260.86 $227.36 NO BID $289.00 $266.90 $162.00 $263.03 NO BID $223.00 $324.95 $276.00 $294.85 $255.00 NO BID $244.90 NO BID

41 (a) $277.17 $282.49 NO BID $289.00 $283.25 $162.00 $279.47 NO BID $255.00 $299.95 $289.00 $265.00 $270.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

42 (a) $244.56 $212.14 NO BID $265.00 $266.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID $255.00 $307.95 NO BID $278.35 $243.00 NO BID $244.90 NO BID

43 (a) $244.56 $242.59 NO BID $249.00 $250.65 NO BID $246.60 NO BID $289.00 $337.95 $259.00 $307.22 $238.00 NO BID $229.59 NO BID

44 (a) $244.56 $251.49 NO BID $275.00 $249.00 NO BID $246.60 NO BID $270.00 $287.95 $258.00 $255.00 $240.00 NO BID $229.59 NO BID

45 (a) $244.56 $212.14 NO BID $265.00 $250.65 NO BID NO BID NO BID $255.00 $307.95 NO BID $278.35 $243.00 NO BID $244.90 NO BID

46 (a) $260.86 $243.78 NO BID $295.00 $266.90 NO BID $263.03 NO BID $288.00 $337.95 NO BID $307.22 $254.00 NO BID $244.90 NO BID
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NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM
BID NO. 1343-N, LCD PROJECTOR LAMPS
FOR PERIOD OF SEPTEMBER 1, 2011 THRU AUGUST 31, 2012

BID RE-CAP, Bids Opened 8/11/10, 2:00 p.m.

47 (a) $298.91 $263.53 NO BID $275.00 $304.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID $275.00 $307.95 NO BID $275.00 $292.00 NO BID $295.92 NO BID

48 (a) $333.69 $345.69 NO BID $290.00 $339.65 $192.00 $336.47 NO BID $284.90 $337.95 $354.00 $301.00 $332.00 NO BID $356.12 NO BID

49 (a) $333.69 $345.69 NO BID $295.00 $339.65 $194.00 NO BID NO BID $289.95 $330.95 $359.00 $295.00 $328.00 NO BID $356.12 NO BID

50 (a) $315.21 $322.19 NO BID $285.00 $321.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID $266.00 $324.95 NO BID $290.00 $307.00 NO BID $326.53 NO BID

51 (a) $355.43 $364.39 NO BID $330.00 $361.35 NO BID $358.39 NO BID $328.00 $394.95 $379.00 $360.00 $350.00 NO BID $376.53 NO BID

52 (a) $333.69 $354.24 NO BID $299.00 $339.65 $199.00 NO BID NO BID $298.99 $349.95 $359.00 $315.00 $330.00 NO BID $356.12 NO BID

53 (a) $355.43 $360.80 NO BID $299.00 $361.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID $292.50 $337.95 NO BID $301.00 NO BID NO BID $333.67 NO BID

54 (a) $304.34 $283.88 NO BID $279.00 $216.25 $119.00 NO BID NO BID $270.65 $312.95 NO BID $277.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

55 (a) $145.65 $142.37 NO BID $219.00 $152.25 $174.00 NO BID NO BID $241.00 $244.95 $156.00 $215.00 $145.00 NO BID $225.19 NO BID

56 (a) $145.65 $146.56 NO BID $219.00 $152.25 $162.00 $143.41 NO BID $210.00 $249.95 $156.00 $218.00 $145.00 NO BID $188.85 NO BID

57 (a) $244.56 $258.94 NO BID $305.00 $255.35 NO BID NO BID $234.00 $279.50 $362.95 $259.00 $331.96 $243.00 NO BID $236.51 NO BID

58 (a) $270.65 $286.32 NO BID $289.00 $281.35 $213.00 NO BID $264.00 $299.00 $324.95 $296.00 $290.00 $268.00 $200.00 $261.00 NO BID

59 (a) $282.60 $293.96 NO BID $325.00 $294.00 NO BID NO BID $264.00 $316.00 $362.95 $307.00 $331.96 $280.00 NO BID $272.22 NO BID

60 (a) $266.30 $233.67 NO BID $299.00 $255.75 $165.00 $254.23 NO BID $235.00 $362.95 $279.00 $331.96 $230.00 $222.00 $240.76 $244.50

61 (a) $369.00 $320.94 NO BID $375.00 $352.90 NO BID $357.42 NO BID $330.00 $424.95 $399.00 $385.00 $320.00 NO BID $331.88 $337.49
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NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM
BID NO. 1343-N, LCD PROJECTOR LAMPS
FOR PERIOD OF SEPTEMBER 1, 2011 THRU AUGUST 31, 2012

BID RE-CAP, Bids Opened 8/11/10, 2:00 p.m.

62 (a) $266.30 $233.18 NO BID $309.00 $257.20 $189.00 $256.42 NO BID $235.00 $362.95 $287.00 $331.96 $232.00 $177.00 $240.76 $244.50

63 (a) $270.65 $237.53 NO BID $275.00 $260.25 NO BID $260.36 NO BID $237.00 $324.95 $289.00 $290.00 $265.00 NO BID $244.59 $248.50

64 (a) $294.56 NO BID NO BID $169.00 $262.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID $240.00 $199.95 $294.00 $170.00 NO BID NO BID $144.76 $279.30

65 (a) $193.47 $192.48 NO BID $245.00 $192.49 NO BID $184.41 NO BID $253.00 $274.95 $210.00 $245.37 NO BID NO BID $188.70 $168.90

66 (a) $297.85 NO BID NO BID $350.00 $474.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID $340.00 $404.95 NO BID $370.00 NO BID NO BID $481.83 NO BID

67 (a) $297.85 NO BID NO BID $299.00 $474.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID $540.00 $349.95 NO BID $315.00 NO BID NO BID $383.65 NO BID

68 (a) $359.76 NO BID NO BID $340.00 $565.00 $162.00 NO BID NO BID $320.00 $359.95 NO BID $410.31 NO BID $194.00 $343.56 NO BID

69 (a) $346.65 NO BID NO BID $339.00 $547.50 $175.00 NO BID NO BID $279.00 $399.95 NO BID $369.07 NO BID $236.00 $342.35 NO BID

1 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.19 NO BID $2.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.89

2 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $125.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $149.99 $145.99 NO BID $140.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $218.40

CATEGORY B - COMPATIBLE LAMPS

CATEGORY B - COMPATIBLE LAMPS   Bidders for Category B shall comply with the following specifications:
1) Products shall not have more than 1% defective rate.
2) Bidders shall provide a statement to define company warranty/guarantee of product performance.
3) If compatible lamp causes damage to a projector that can be traced back to the fault of the lamp, awarded vendor(s) shall reimburse district for all service cost incurred to repair or 
replace the projector.
4) All information on specification sheets must be completed for each item bid, including ANSI Lumens, Life Hours, and Warranty.
5) Please note Manufacturer AND Part # in the "Manufacturer Ordering Number" column.
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NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM
BID NO. 1343-N, LCD PROJECTOR LAMPS
FOR PERIOD OF SEPTEMBER 1, 2011 THRU AUGUST 31, 2012

BID RE-CAP, Bids Opened 8/11/10, 2:00 p.m.

3 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $340.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $244.00 $210.00 $235.99 NO BID $223.33 NO BID NO BID $155.07 $183.40

4 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $185.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $165.00 $204.95 NO BID $182.00 NO BID NO BID $194.31 $135.80

5 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $205.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $159.00 $192.95 NO BID $166.00 NO BID NO BID $174.34 $143.85

6 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $235.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $189.50 $276.95 NO BID $247.42 NO BID NO BID NO BID $146.65

7 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $175.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $172.00 $149.75 $142.95 NO BID $165.00 NO BID NO BID $167.15 $154.55

8 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $250.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $195.00 $276.95 NO BID $247.42 NO BID NO BID NO BID $165.00

9 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $175.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $154.50 $180.95 NO BID $158.00 NO BID NO BID $132.90 $139.00

10 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $175.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $160.00 $292.95 NO BID $173.00 NO BID NO BID $172.94 $154.55
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NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM
BID NO. 1343-N, LCD PROJECTOR LAMPS
FOR PERIOD OF SEPTEMBER 1, 2011 THRU AUGUST 31, 2012

BID RE-CAP, Bids Opened 8/11/10, 2:00 p.m.

11 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $175.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $160.00 $192.95 NO BID $173.00 NO BID NO BID $171.99 $146.50

12 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $160.00 $192.95 NO BID $164.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $154.55

13 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $205.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $210.00 $169.50 $204.95 NO BID $177.00 NO BID NO BID $176.70 $147.15

14 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $215.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $205.00 $252.95 NO BID $220.00 NO BID NO BID $164.91 $190.15

15 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $225.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $210.00 $252.95 NO BID $220.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $239.80

16 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $250.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $233.00 $195.00 $276.95 NO BID $247.42 NO BID NO BID NO BID $165.00

17 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $194.50 $180.95 NO BID $164.44 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

18 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $169.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $167.50 $240.95 $264.00 $211.34 NO BID NO BID NO BID $146.37

19 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $169.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $167.50 $276.95 $289.00 $247.42 NO BID NO BID NO BID $211.82

20 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $165.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $169.50 $175.95 $168.00 $150.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $144.51
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PROJECTOR 
LAMP 

EXPERTS

PYRAMID 
SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS
QUILL SCOTT 

ELECTRIC

SEHI 
COMPUTER 
PRODUCTS

SPECIALTY 
BULB CO. TROXELL VALIANT IMC

NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM
BID NO. 1343-N, LCD PROJECTOR LAMPS
FOR PERIOD OF SEPTEMBER 1, 2011 THRU AUGUST 31, 2012

BID RE-CAP, Bids Opened 8/11/10, 2:00 p.m.

21 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $169.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $179.00 $167.50 $240.95 NO BID $211.34 NO BID NO BID $249.96 $182.07

22 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $165.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $169.50 $175.95 $229.00 $150.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $159.46

23 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $229.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $164.00 $205.00 $252.95 $240.00 $223.71 NO BID NO BID NO BID $177.57

24 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $299.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $172.00 $239.50 $336.95 NO BID $306.19 NO BID NO BID NO BID $327.25

25 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $225.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $149.00 $205.00 $251.95 NO BID $210.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $155.89

26 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $250.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $179.00 $199.50 $276.95 NO BID $247.42 NO BID NO BID NO BID $204.68

27 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $185.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $189.00 $199.95 NO BID $171.13 NO BID NO BID NO BID $160.84

28 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $259.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $184.00 $201.00 $279.95 NO BID $258.76 NO BID NO BID NO BID $271.32

29 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $179.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $174.00 $190.15 $204.95 NO BID $175.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

30 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $154.00 $209.50 $264.95 $277.00 $235.05 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

31 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $271.13 NO BID NO BID NO BID $260.60
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ITEM NO. AVI-SPL CAMCOR, INC
CCS 

Presentation 
Systems

COMPETITIVE 
EDGE

DATEL 
SYSTEMS, INC.

DLP LAMP 
SOURCE

GOLDEN STAR 
TECHNOLOGY (GST)

PATHWAY 
COMM.

PROJECTOR 
LAMP 

EXPERTS

PYRAMID 
SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS
QUILL SCOTT 

ELECTRIC

SEHI 
COMPUTER 
PRODUCTS

SPECIALTY 
BULB CO. TROXELL VALIANT IMC

NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM
BID NO. 1343-N, LCD PROJECTOR LAMPS
FOR PERIOD OF SEPTEMBER 1, 2011 THRU AUGUST 31, 2012

BID RE-CAP, Bids Opened 8/11/10, 2:00 p.m.

32 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $235.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $258.76 NO BID NO BID NO BID $236.80

33 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $239.00 $210.00 $240.95 NO BID $211.34 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

34 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $165.00 $179.10 $192.95 NO BID $163.92 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

35 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $298.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

36 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $131.96 NO BID NO BID NO BID $121.38

37 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $224.07 NO BID NO BID NO BID $213.00

38 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $195.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $137.00 $168.95 NO BID $139.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $143.84

39 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $195.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $137.00 $168.95 NO BID $139.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $143.84

40 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $229.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $222.00 $210.00 $216.95 NO BID $202.22 NO BID NO BID $166.90 $180.88

41 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $205.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $189.50 $228.95 $297.00 $202.00 NO BID NO BID $166.90 $166.60

42 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $155.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $137.00 $168.95 NO BID $139.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $143.84
43 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $155.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $137.70 $187.95 NO BID $159.79 NO BID NO BID NO BID $143.32

44 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $247.00 $205.00 $228.95 NO BID $200.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $189.20
45 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $155.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $137.00 $168.95 NO BID $139.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $143.84
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ITEM NO. AVI-SPL CAMCOR, INC
CCS 

Presentation 
Systems

COMPETITIVE 
EDGE

DATEL 
SYSTEMS, INC.

DLP LAMP 
SOURCE

GOLDEN STAR 
TECHNOLOGY (GST)

PATHWAY 
COMM.

PROJECTOR 
LAMP 

EXPERTS

PYRAMID 
SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS
QUILL SCOTT 

ELECTRIC

SEHI 
COMPUTER 
PRODUCTS

SPECIALTY 
BULB CO. TROXELL VALIANT IMC

NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM
BID NO. 1343-N, LCD PROJECTOR LAMPS
FOR PERIOD OF SEPTEMBER 1, 2011 THRU AUGUST 31, 2012

BID RE-CAP, Bids Opened 8/11/10, 2:00 p.m.

46 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $155.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $136.00 $187.95 NO BID $159.78 NO BID NO BID NO BID $143.32

47 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $155.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $136.10 $187.95 NO BID $159.78 NO BID NO BID NO BID $123.45

48 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $210.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $204.50 $264.95 NO BID $231.00 NO BID NO BID $193.27 $163.55

49 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $210.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $204.50 $276.95 NO BID $245.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $156.95

50 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $220.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $210.00 $205.50 $216.95 NO BID $202.22 NO BID NO BID NO BID $174.93

51 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $250.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $239.00 $231.50 $288.95 NO BID $255.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $173.10

52 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $230.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $228.00 $214.50 $264.95 NO BID $229.00 NO BID NO BID $227.79 $164.74

53 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $210.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $204.50 $276.95 NO BID $245.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $168.30

54 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $195.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $185.40 $180.95 NO BID $164.44 NO BID NO BID NO BID $127.18

55 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $195.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $173.50 $204.95 NO BID $176.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $151.30

56 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $170.50 $204.95 NO BID $190.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $171.88

57 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $215.10 $252.95 NO BID $223.71 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

58 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $205.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $217.00 $196.50 $228.95 NO BID $200.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $175.45

59 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $215.00 $264.95 NO BID $235.05 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

60 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $195.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $196.00 $173.10 $204.95 NO BID $176.00 NO BID NO BID $173.28 $162.90

Bid Tabulation, pending award determinations 11 NCEPC Bid #1343-N, Projector Lamps



ITEM NO. AVI-SPL CAMCOR, INC
CCS 

Presentation 
Systems

COMPETITIVE 
EDGE

DATEL 
SYSTEMS, INC.

DLP LAMP 
SOURCE

GOLDEN STAR 
TECHNOLOGY (GST)

PATHWAY 
COMM.

PROJECTOR 
LAMP 

EXPERTS

PYRAMID 
SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS
QUILL SCOTT 

ELECTRIC

SEHI 
COMPUTER 
PRODUCTS

SPECIALTY 
BULB CO. TROXELL VALIANT IMC

NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM
BID NO. 1343-N, LCD PROJECTOR LAMPS
FOR PERIOD OF SEPTEMBER 1, 2011 THRU AUGUST 31, 2012

BID RE-CAP, Bids Opened 8/11/10, 2:00 p.m.

61 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $210.00 $300.95 $284.00 $271.13 NO BID NO BID $241.57 $192.11

62 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $185.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $199.99 $173.10 $204.95 $259.00 $176.00 NO BID NO BID $205.77 $174.26

63 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $245.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $192.00 $252.95 $242.00 $223.71 NO BID NO BID $176.19 $171.88

64 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $115.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $109.10 $145.95 NO BID $118.56 NO BID NO BID $91.76 $121.88

65 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

66 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $203.50 NO BID NO BID $316.49 NO BID NO BID NO BID $260.60

67 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $220.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $210.00 $252.95 NO BID $219.00 NO BID NO BID $176.79 $249.25

68 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $199.50 $192.95 NO BID $164.44 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

69 (b) NO BID NO BID NO BID $205.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $281.00 $182.50 $229.95 NO BID $201.03 NO BID NO BID $175.24 $176.64

1 ( c ) 21%
www.avispl.com

5%
www.camcor.co

m

5%
www.datelstore.

com

31.4%
www.dlplampsou

rce.com

10.1% off 
MSRP

4%
www.pathwayco
mmunicationsltd

.com

10%
www.projectorla
mpexperts.com

40% EIKO LCD 
LAMP LIST 

PRICE

5%
www.specialtyla

mpdepot.com

Varies
www.buysehied

u.com

5%
www.trox.com

5%
www.800valiant

.com

CATEGORY C - % OFF CATALOG PRICES
For projector lamps not specifically listed on the bid, all bidders are requested to provide a percentage off discount. Please list the discount and attach catalog if 

available or website address.
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