
CAJON VALLEY SCHOOL DISTRICT
BID RECAP – BID #1339
Lower Emission School Bus Program Retrofit Project
Transportation Department
Bids Opened:  June 17, 2011, 2:00 P.M.

RETROFIT MODEL 
AND FAMILY NAME

Est. 
Quantity

 UNIT COST
(Each Bus) 

 EXTENDED
Total Cost 

 UNIT COST
(Each Bus) 

 EXTENDED
Total Cost 

 UNIT COST
(Each Bus) 

 EXTENDED
Total Cost 

 UNIT COST
(Each Bus) 

 EXTENDED
Total Cost 

Lot 1:

Data Logging Procedures 8 $0.00 $0.00 2,865.00$    22,920.00$    NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00
Cleaire Horizon 
CA/CLE/2005/PM3+/N00/ON/DPF01 8 13,772.26$  110,178.08$  13,087.69$  104,701.52$  NO BID NO BID 14,896.81$  119,174.48$  

TOTAL
Lot 1: 110,178.08$  

TOTAL
Lot 1: 127,621.52$  

TOTAL
Lot 1: NO BID

TOTAL
Lot 1: 119,174.48$  

Lot 2:

Data Logging Procedures 10 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID 100.00$       1,000.00$      NO BID NO BID

ESW Thermacat
CA/ESW/2009/PM3+/N00/ON/DPF01 10 15,691.64$  156,916.40$  NO BID NO BID 16,195.64$  161,956.40$  NO BID NO BID

TOTAL
Lot 2: 156,916.40$  

TOTAL
Lot 2: NO BID

TOTAL
Lot 2: 162,956.40$  

TOTAL
Lot 2: NO BID

Plan Holders: 10
Bids Received: 4
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